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The objective of this study was designed to compare the faculty self-ratings with the student ratings at 
school of pharmacy in AJUMS in 2009. This study was designed as a descriptive cross-sectional study.  
All 180 students and 25 faculty members of the school of pharmacy were participated in the study.  
Both groups accomplished the same questionnaire including 15 evaluation items. The questionnaire 
was based on 5-point, Likert scale from poor to excellent (1 to5). The mean of faculty self-ratings was 
4.52±0.34 and of student ratings was 4.04±0.39, (p<0.001). 92.6% of faculty members evaluated 
themselves as excellent (more than 4). However, 48.1% of students evaluated their faculties as excellent 
(more than 4). Correlation between student ratings and faculty self-ratings was 0.40(p=0.039). Faculty 
self-ratings and the evaluation of faculty teaching by students was significantly different. It means that 
either the methods of teaching were not satisfied to the students or the faculty members were self-
centered. The reason of this discrepancy should be considered in next studies. 
 
Keywords: Student-rating, Faculty self-rating, evaluation, students, faculty. 

 
 
INTRODUCTION 
 
Student evaluations are the most commonly used method 
of assessing an instructor’s effectiveness in high 
education. A purported use of student evaluation is for 
faculty members to improve their teaching, although 
personnel decision-making is more often the reason 
behind student evaluation (Yao Y 2005; Surratt 2007).  

Despite the documented reliability and validity of 
student evaluations, whether students have enough 
content knowledge to effectively evaluate teaching has 
been the subject of debate in the educational research 
literature (Tozoglu 2009; Onwuegbuzie 2009; Beran 
2009). However, the student ratings have always been an 
argumentative approach from the faculty.  In addressing 
this concern, faculty member self-evaluations, in addition 
to student evaluations, have been recommended as a 
more holistic approach (Dennis, 1990; Karamdoust, 
2004).  
   Adams (1997) suggested that the evaluation of 
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teaching has never been criticized for revealing students' 
satisfaction with the teaching performance, but they have 
been mostly criticized for acting as a scale to measure 
the instruction efficiency. He believes that student ratings 
is not aiming at a summative evaluation but seeking a 
formative evaluation in order to promote the teaching 
performance (Adams, 1997). Therefore, the most 
important purpose of student ratings is to prepare 
feedback for faculty members to improve their teaching 
method and educational performance. 

Jacobs (1987) investigated ideas of more than one 
hundred faculty members, and then realized that 
although they were not mainly opposed to student 
evaluation, they supposed that students are not at the 
position to judge about certain issues such as 
"instructor's knowledge and his updated information". 
Results from another study on views of academic staffs 
of the School of Pharmacy were shown that although 
there were less positive views about student ratings, the 
results of the ratings were applied in teaching methods 
and improved the quality of performance (Barnett 1997).   
According to Marsh and Roche (1993), faculty members 
provided with student evaluation feedback and 
consultations received significantly higher ratings within a 
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year than faculty members who did not receive any 
feedback or consultations.  

There are many factors that seem to have an impact on 
faculty use of student evaluation feedback to improve 
their teaching. According to Centra (1993), teaching 
improvement occurs only if a faculty member knows how 
to make changes and is motivated to do so. Even if 
faculty members know how to interpret student evaluation 
results, they may not know what to do in order to improve 
their teaching (Jacobs, 1987).  However, student ratings 
do have their limitations, especially when they represent 
the only method of teaching evaluation used in tenure or 
promotion decisions.  Departments should gather 
evidence of teaching effectiveness from a variety of 
sources.  These may include: peer evaluations, letters 
from students, syllabi and instructional support materials, 
and individual teaching portfolios.  Student evaluations, if 
they are properly constructed, should be part of this mix 
because they offer an indispensible perspective on an 
instructor’s effectiveness.  Moreover, student feedback is 
an important tool for individual instructors who wish to 
improve their teaching. 

Research studies have investigated the faculty 
attitudes toward student ratings related to faculty 
background variables, such as academic rank, age, 
discipline (Aghamolayi, 2008; Chang, 2003). However, 
these background variables can not deeply explain why 
some faculty members agree with student ratings and 
some do not.  Most of these “faculty attitudes” studies 
have assumed that faculty may feel more positively 
toward student ratings if they are highly rated by their 
students (Chang, 2003). 

Many studies have examined different aspects of 
evaluating faculty members (Maaroufi 2007; Vahid-shahi 
2009; Moor, 2009), but faculty self-ratings have been 
assessed less. In Iran, there are also a few numbers of 
comprehensive studies which assess the relationship 
between student ratings and faculty self-ratings 
(Aghamolayi 2008; Vahid-shahi 2009). Self-assessment 
is one of the best methods to evaluate faculty members, 
which has not been taken seriously in Iranian Universities 
and is yet to have not a procedure to be carried out. 
Faculty members are considered as an evident source for 
collecting data about them, with no one except them 
having a deep and forthright view about themselves. That 
is why some researchers consider faculty self-ratings as 
a useful tool to improve valuable teaching skills (Daniel 
2006). This may enable faculty members to recognize 
their faults in teaching performance through self-
monitoring and alleviating the faults in order to make 
steps towards a perfect quality. The simultaneous use of 
student ratings and faculty self-ratings is a method which 
is now being used at most of major universities across 
the world to make changes and progress in their teaching 
programs.    

The following study was conducted to address the 
methodological concerns about the evaluation of teaching 

 
 
 
 
methodological concerns about the evaluation of teaching 
that are outlined above. The objectives were (1) to 
determine the differences between the results obtained 
from student evaluations of faculty member performance 
with those obtained by faculty member self-evaluations of 
their performance, and (2) to determine the relationships 
between the overall results of student evaluations with 
faculty self- evaluations at Ahvaz Jundishapur University 
of Medical Sciences (AJUMS) in 2009. 

 
 
METHODS  
 
Thirty-one faculty members at the AJUMS School of 
Pharmacy were asked to participate. The faculty 
members completed self-evaluations of their teaching 
within courses. Students completed separate in-class 
evaluations of each of the course faculty members at the 
conclusion of that faculty member’s teaching. 

Faculty members and students used the same 
evaluation criteria, which included 14 items measuring 
specific aspects of instruction and 1 item measuring 
overall teaching ability with 5-point Likert scale from poor 
to excellent, with scores from 1 to 5 to evaluate the 
teaching (Table1). 

The validity of the questionnaire was already approved 
in a study conducted at the University Educational 
Development Center (EDC). The reliability of the 
questionnaire was also approved at the same center 
through calculating Chronbach alpha with α=0.84.  

First, a copy of results from evaluation of all faculty 
members, kept at the archives of the EDC, was prepared 
and coded. Each faculty member was sent a coded self-
rating questionnaire along with a paper explaining the 
purpose and necessity of the study. Each academic staff 
was given a code to prevent the  appearance of their 
names in questionnaires. Then they were asked to fill the 
questionnaire on their own teaching performance. Those 
faculty members who did not complete their self-rating 
questionnaire or were not evaluated by students were 
omitted of the study.  

The analysis of the data was carried out by the use of 
SPSS-15 program. The indices of descriptive statistics, 
including mean and standard deviation were used to 
summarize the data. ANOVA and t tests were utilized to 
compare means and Pearson correlation coefficient was 
used.  
 
 
RESULTS  
 
Twenty-seven self-rating questionnaires were completed 
and returned (response rate 87%). Out of 27 faculty 
members, 8 (29.6%) were women and 19 (70.4%) were 
men. Two faculty members held the rank of  professor,  6 
were associate professors, 15 were assistants, and 4 
were instructor. 



Shakurnia and Karami  1591 
 
 
 

Table1. Mean and standard deviation of faculty self-rating and student ratings at school of Pharmacy            
 

Items Student rating Self - rating Diff Mean Correlation 

1-Instructor's punctuality and watching out 
class time   

4.18±0.58 4.59±0.64 -0.41* 0.680** 

2-highlighting purpose and content of course 
at every single session 

3.89±0.45 4.37±0.49 -0.48* 0.150 

3-Observing cohesion and consistency of the 
content area(s) 

3.92±0.48 4.41±0.50 -0.48* 0.242 

4-Presenting comprehensive examples and 
proper exercises   

3.80±0.43 4.44±0.64 -0.54* 0.412* 

5- Instructor's knowledge of the content 
area(s) and the capability in answering 
questions 

3.93±0.37 4.59±0.50 -0.56* 0.292 

6-Presenting an outline for content area(s) 
and keeping it during semester 

3.81±0.50 3.93±0.73 -0.12 0.328 

7-Use of new and various sources available 3.80±0.46 4.46±0.65 -0.56* -0.029 

8-Instructor's attention to students' 
attendance in class 

4.14±0.22 4.52±0.70 -0.37* 0.139 

9-Instructor's ability to manage the class 4.15±0.30 4.54±0.58 -0.39* 0.192 

10-Instructor's willingness to teach students 3.92±0.43 4.73±0.45 -0.31* -0.190 

11- Enhancement of student class 
participation 

3.91±0.40 4.56±0.57 -0.54* -0.216 

12-Motivating students to further research 
and study 

3.69±0.41 4.33±0.73 -0.53* -0.218 

13-Assessing class learning during semester 3.80±0.37 3.85±0.91 -0.05 0.125 

14-Instructor's social behavior with students 
and mutual respect 

4.21±0.43 4.54±0.58 -0.32* 0.570** 

15-Student's overall evaluation of instructor 3.89±0.30 4.29±0.46 -0.39* 0.498* 

Total Mean 3.94±0.33 4.37±0.31 -0.43* 0.400* 

 
 
 
 
 
The majority of the faculty members (92.6%) were 
evaluated themselves at scores higher than 4 (excellent 
level), while only 48.1 percent of students evaluated the 
faculty members’ teaching performance with scores 
higher than 4 (excellent level).  

Analysis of variance was conducted on the combined 
data for all instruction to determine if there were 
significant differences among the mean ratings by the 
faculty members and student subsets for each evaluation 
item (Table 1). The most significant difference found 
between the faculty members’ self-evaluation scores and 
the mean scores for student evaluations was presented. 
Analyses were also conducted at the level of individual 
instruction, defined as each instruction event. For every 
data record, t-tests were conducted on each of the 15 
evaluation items to see how the faculty self-rating 
compared to the mean student rating. For each item, 
significant differences and the direction of the differences 
were recorded. For all 15 items, when significant 
differences between faculty member and class ratings 
occurred, the faculty members rated themselves higher 
on the item than did the students in their class (figure 1). 

The most frequently occurring difference between the 
faculty members’ rating themselves and the ratings by 
the students in their classes was for the evaluation item, “ 
Instructor's knowledge,” and “Use of new  sources,” for 
which half (50.0%) of the faculty members rated 
themselves higher than their students did. In evaluating 
faculty members, students gave the highest average 
score to question number 14, "faculty member's social 
behavior with students and mutual respect" (4.21±0.43). 
The lowest average score was given to question number 
12 "motivate students to carry out further research and 
study" (3.69±0.41). When self-evaluating, faculty 
members gave the highest score to question number 1 
"academic staff's on time attendance in classroom and 
monitoring the class time" (4.59±0.64) and question 
number 5 "good comprehension of material and ability to 
answer questions" (4.59±0.50). They gave the lowest 
score to question number 13 "evaluating students' 
learning  in  classroom  during  a  semester"  (3.85±0.91). 

The highest difference between faculty self-ratings and 
student ratings was for question number  7  "use  of  new 
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 Figure1. Liner comparison between faculty self-ratings and Student ratings at School of Pharmacy in 
AJUMS 

 

 
 
 
 
sources" (-0.56), and the lowest difference came for 
question number 6 "presenting students an outline for the 
course and keep it on during the whole semester" (-0.12).  

Results from the study indicated that the total average 
score of faculty self-ratings was higher than that of 
student ratings (t=6.329 and p<0.0001). The total 
average score of student ratings was at 3.94±0.33 
(scores ranging from 3.29 to 4.58), while faculty self-
ratings mean score stood at 4.37±0.31 (scores ranging 
from 3.73 to 4.87) (Table1). 

The average score of female faculty self-ratings was 
4.33±0.25, while the average score of male faculty self-
ratings was 4.39±0.34. There were no significant 
differences between male and female faculty members. 
The average score of student ratings of female faculty 
members was at 3.70±0.36 and for male faculty members 
standing at 4.04± 0.27. There was a significant difference 
between the means (t=2.71 and p=0.012).  

The average scores of faculty self-ratings stood at 
4.37±0.31, 4.61±0.35, 4.33±0.34, and 4.48±0.31 
respectively for instructor, assistant, associate professor 
and professor. The average scores of student ratings 
stood at 3.87±0.37, 3.91±0.33, 3.99±0.39, and 4.14±0.08 
respectively for instructor, assistant, associate professor 
and professor.  No   significant   difference was shown 
between evaluation scores and faculty members rank. A 
correlation coefficiency of  0.400  was  seen between 
faculty self-ratings and student ratings scores (p=0.039). 

 
 
DISCUSSION  
 
This study has documented that, overall, faculty 
members self-evaluations of their teaching and student 
evaluations produce no similar results. The results 

indicate that the average score of faculty self-ratings is 
significantly higher than the average score of student 
ratings. Similar results have already been reported in 
previous studies (Mohammad, 2007; Aghamolayi, 2008; 
Vahid-shahi, 2009). Two separate surveys conducted at 
Mazandaran and Hormozgan Universities of Medical 
Sciences revealed that the average score of faculty self-
ratings was higher than the average score of student 
ratings, and that there was a significant statistical 
difference between the scores (Aghamolayi, 2008; 
Mohammad jaafari  2007).  

   A study conducted on 343 faculty members of five 
schools in New Jersey, indicated that faculty members, in 
comparison with students, had better assessment of 
teaching and gave themselves higher scores (Centra, 
1973). In addition, results from a similar study carried on 
17 faculty members of University of Illinois showed that 
the average score of faculty self-ratings of teaching had 
been higher than the average scores of student ratings, 
but statistically significant difference was not seen 
(Braskamp,1979). Furthermore, results from Barnett 
study conducted on 31 faculty members of School of 
Pharmacy of Mercer University indicated that faculty self-
evaluation and student ratings had produced same 
results in general (Barnett, 2003). Results from these 
studies do not correspond with the results of similar 
studies conducted in Iran, probably faculty members at 
foreign universities have a positive attitude toward the 
evaluation of teaching, and there is psychical security 
and the culture of self-assessment (Ross, 2007; Idaka 
2006). 

 The higher self-ratings of faculty members indicate that 
faculty members have a more positive attitude about 
themselves. Faculty disapproval of student evaluation, 
different attitudes about appropriate teaching, and lack of  



 
 
 
 
an equal understanding of effective teaching are seemed 
to be some of the main reasons behind the 
disagreement. Mistrust, lack of psychical security, and 
absence of the culture of self-assessment also 
contributed to the reasons. Although some of the 
aforementioned reasons to some extent may justify the 
disagreement between faculty and student attitudes, 
further studies are definitely needed to identify the real 
reasons. The results of several studies provide a general 
consensus about some apparent dimensions of self-
evaluation condition in society (Motlagh, 2000; Evans, 
2002; Sicaja, 2006).These include (1) the lack of assuring 
conditions for self-assessment, (2) the lack of the culture 
of self-evaluation in the society, (3) and necessity for 
change in the society's culture to make a successful self-
assessment. 

   A review on the teaching evaluation questionnaire, 
item by item, showed that there was a significant 
statistical difference between faculty self-rating scores 
and student rating scores for most items, and this to 
some extent corresponded with the results from similar 
studies so far conducted in Iran (Aghamolayi, 2008, 
Mohammad, 2007; Adhami, 2005; Najafi, 2000). The 
highest difference between faculty self-ratings and 
student ratings was observed in items 10, 7, 11 and 12 
respectively (Table 1). The difference in such items which 
are mostly related to the teaching methods and skills led 
to the conclusion that there was almost a high difference 
between the faculty members and student attitudes. 
Comparisons have revealed that faculty members and 
students have the most different opinions about creating 
motivation in students and class participation. Paying 
attention to students during class time and making proper 
relation with them are among the main pillars of a 
dynamic and active teaching method, which also 
stimulate and facilitate purposeful learning. Therefore, 
faculty members must be aware of these pillars and 
should motivate students in order to provide them with 
appropriate opportunities.  

   A review on questionnaire's evaluation items also 
indicated that the least difference between faculty self-
ratings and student ratings was respectively for items 8, 
13, and 1 (Table 1). The items were mostly related to 
academics personal features, and revealed less different 
ideas between faculty members and students. This has 
corresponded with the results from a study by 
Aghamolayi (Aghamolayi, 2008). 

The educational performance of faculties in universities 
is continuously assessed by students in order to promote 
the quality of education. Results from various studies are 
indicative of the fact that student evaluation of teaching is 
effective in improving teaching performance (Cohen 
1980; Shakurnia, 2001; Kember 2002; Jouybari 2009). 
However an important issue is that how much faculty 
members approve student ratings so that they use the 
reflection of the results as a useful source to improve  
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their teaching performance. The Results of this study 
indicate that faculty members have put themselves at 
higher ranks in most of cases, and this reveals a 
significant disagreement between students and faculty 
members as far as a general attitude toward evaluation 
and the quality of teaching is concerned. Therefore, it 
appears that the differences between faculty and student 
attitudes may complicate efforts for improving the quality 
of teaching. Such differences may also hinder the 
optimization process of the teaching quality, which is 
among the main purposes behind the evaluation process. 
Therefore, such an issue demands strong attention of the 
faculty officials. In addition, concerning the results of this 
study and the importance of faculty evaluation in 
promoting the quality of teaching, it is suggested that:  
1) Grounds be prepared for increasing approval of 
evaluation results by faculty members through making 
appropriate planning and creating a positive attitude 
toward student ratings.  
2) Correspondence be enhanced between viewpoints of 
faculty members and elite students regarding the 
evaluation questionnaire items through meetings held by 
faculty members and elite students on evaluation.  
3) The degree of the approval of results by faculty 
members be increased via periodical consulting with 
them about different dimensions of evaluation and 
motivating them to participate in the evaluation process.  
4) Faculty members be provided with guides on the use 
of weaknesses and strengths as well as the improvement 
of the teaching performance when they are informed of 
the results of the evaluation. 
Although the subset of this study was larger than those of 
studies conducted previously, it had some restrictions 
too. Students with associate of arts diploma degree, 
bachelor's degree, and doctorate, as well as instructors 
with various specializations in different majors 
participated in the study. Such a variety could affect the 
results of the study. Therefore, extra surveys devoid of 
the   impacts   by   such   factors   are   recommended.  
 
 
CONCLUSION  
 
The results indicated that the average score of faculty 
self-ratings were significantly higher than the average 
score of student ratings. In all evaluation items, faculty 
members had more positive views about the teaching 
performance than students did. This revealed a 
disagreement between viewpoints of faculty members 
and students as far as the educational performance and 
the evaluation of the teaching's quality were concerned. 
Since the most important purpose behind such studies is 
to provide faculty members with reflections aimed at 
improving the educational performance and promoting. 
So for the acceptance and adoption of evaluation results 
for faculty members should be planned. 
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