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ABSTRACT 

 

Congenital diaphragmatic hernia is uncommon with an incidence of 1 in 2000 to 3500 live births. 
Less than 20% of cases present outside the neonatal period frequently posing diagnostic 
challenges. We report a case of congenital diaphragmatic hernia in a three-year-old boy who had 
previously been treated at other centres without a definitive diagnosis. This is aimed at highlighting 
the diagnostic and treatment challenges involved in the management of this patient. 
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INTRODUCTION 
 
A diaphragmatic hernia is defined as a communication 
between the abdominal and thoracic cavities with or 
without abdominal contents in the thorax (Narkhede et 
al., 2014). The most common type is the posterolateral 
type (Bochdalek) (Morin et al., 1994). The incidence 
has been reported as 1 in 3,500 live births but 
increased to 1 in 2000 if still births are included (Morin 
et al., 1994). Congenital diaphragmatic hernia (CDH) 
accounts for 8% of all congenital anomalies (Stolar CJ 
and Dillon P, 2006). The aetiology is unknown, however 
2% of cases have been noted to be familial while 15% 
have associated congenital anomalies (King H and 
Booker PD, 2005). Most infants with congenital 
diaphragmatic hernia are born term, two thirds are male 
and in 90% of cases, the hernia is left sided (Morin et 
al., 1994). The spectrum of disease of CDH may range 
from asymptomatic defects not diagnosed in the 
neonatal period to presentations with immediate 
respiratory failure presenting in neonatal death (Tsao K 
and Lally KP, 2012). 

Few cases of congenital diaphragmatic hernia have 
been reported in western (Grillo et al., 1977, 
Adejuyigbe et al 1998, Adegboye et al., 2002) and 
Northern Nigeria (Abubakar et al., 2011) but none in 
Southern Nigeria. This case is herein reported to 
highlight its existence in this part of the country as well 
as discuss its diagnostic and management challenges. 
 
 
CASE  
 
GE, a three-year-old male presented to the children 
emergency room of the Niger Delta University Teaching 

Hospital (NDUTH) with complaints of difficulty with 
breathing from birth, cough and fever of a month’s 
duration. 

Difficulty with breathing started from birth with fast 
breathing and chest indrawing. It was aggravated by 
ingestion of feeds. There was no change in body colour 
and it was not related to activity or change in position. 
There was no history of easy fatigability. Cough was 
non-paroxysmal, productive of whitish non-blood 
stained sputum. It was distressful and worse at night. 
There was no history of contact with an adult with 
chronic cough and no night sweats. Fever was high 
grade, worse at night and temporarily relieved by 
paracetamol. On systemic review, there was a positive 
history of weight loss. 

His mother had been taking him to traditional 
healers for local massage. She had also taken him 
several times to patent medicine dealers who gave 
unknown drugs which only temporarily relieved the 
difficulty with breathing. At the onset of cough, she took 
him to a private hospital where a chest xray and blood 
tests were done but she was not told the diagnosis. 
She decided to bring him to the NDUTH as difficulty 
with breathing worsened. 

He was admitted at a private hospital six months 
prior to present admission for similar illness. His 
pregnancy was supervised at the NDUTH and was 
carried to term. It was said to have been uneventful. 
Pregnancy ultrasound scan was not done. Delivery was 
supervised at home by a traditional birth attendant and 
was spontaneous vaginal. He was the last of seven 
children of parents in a monogamous family, three 
males and four females. His siblings were all well.    His  
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Figure 1: Chest x-ray 
 
mother was a 36-year-old farmer while his father was a 
40-year-old carpenter. Both parents had primary 
education. They all lived in a one bedroom flat with the 
seven children sleeping in the living room. 

On examination, he was in respiratory distress with 
flaring alar nasi, intercostal and subcostal recession, 
and was mildly pale. His weight was 11.5kg which was 
86% of expected for age. His height was 88cm which 
was 92.6% of expected for age and his mid upper arm 
circumference was 13cm which showed borderline 
nutrition. He had a normal respiratory rate of 36 cycles 
per minute with an oxygen saturation of 97 to 98%. His 
anterior chest wall was asymmetrical with bulging on 
the left hemithorax. There was tracheal deviation to the 
right. Percussion notes were resonant on the right 
hemithorax but dull on the left. Bowel sounds were 
heard over the left hemithorax while rhonchi were heard 
on the right. Other systems were essentially normal. 

A provisional diagnosis of left diaphragmatic hernia 
was made. Chest x-ray showed presence of bowel 
loops in the left hemithorax with mediastinal shift to the 
right (figure 1). 

He was nebulized with salbutamol, received tabs 
prednisolone, antimalarial, and intravenous cefuroxime. 
He was reviewed by the cardiothoracic surgeon who 
planned for corrective surgery at a later date. His 
mother requested to be discharged to enable her 
source for funds for his surgery but they have not 
returned till date. 
 
 
DISCUSSION 
 
Congenital diaphragmatic hernia is associated with high 
morbidity and mortality due to two complications 
namely pulmonary hypoplasia and pulmonary 
hypertension (Narkhede et al., 1994). Although the 
mortality in the late diagnosis group is low, the 
morbidity may be significant (Behrman et al., 1988). 
Most cases of CDH who present after the neonatal 
period survive as they have less severe pulmonary 
hypoplasia (Grillo et al., 1977 and Butler et al., 1993). 
Late presentation outside the neonatal period as in the 
index case is present in 2.6 to 20% of all cases 
between the ages of 1 month to 18 years (Kitano et al., 
2005). Other researchers in Nigeria (Grillo et al., 1977; 
Adejuyigbe et al., 1998; Adegboye et al., 2002 and 

Abubakar et al., 2011) and other countries (Chetan et 
al., 2008; Radovic SV, 2015 and Kim et al., 2011) have 
also reported cases of late presenting CDH. 

Over 90% of patients with CDH are likely to either 
be diagnosed antenatally or within the first few hours of 
life (Davenport and Holmes 1995), but this was not the 
case in the index patient whose mother did not have 
antenatal ultra-sound scan. Prenatal detection of CDH 
is said to be uncommon in developing countries like 
Nigeria due to inadequate facilities (Abubakar et al., 
2011). Abubakar et al. (2011) in University of Maiduguri 
teaching hospital, Nigeria also reported a similar trend 
among seven cases managed over an eight-year 
period where 80% of the mothers had abdominal 
ultrasound scan in pregnancy but no antenatal 
diagnosis was made. Similarly, Mallikarjunapp and 
Ashish (2012) in India reported a case of CDH made in 
a term neonate whose mother had antenatal ultrasound 
scan which revealed no abnormality. His delivery was 
also supervised by a traditional birth attendant who 
probably lacked the skills to identify problems and 
promptly refer him to a health centre. Late presenting 
CDH often presents considerable diagnostic challenge 
because of its varied presentation resulting in 
diagnostic delay, inappropriate treatment and 
potentially fatal outcome (Behrman et al., 1988). The 
index patient had been treated on several occasions by 
patent medicine dealers and traditional healers and 
was also managed at a private hospital where the 
diagnosis was missed even if a chest x-ray was done. 
Wrong diagnosis of CDH is present in about 25% of 
cases as pneumonia, pneumothorax, congenital cystic 
adenomatoid malformation of the lungs, pleural effusion 
or eventration of the diaphragm (Elhalaby EA and Abo 
Sikeena, 2002). Abubakar et al. (2011) as well as 
Lemos et al. (2015) in India also reported similar 
incidents of repeated treatment for pneumonia at 
peripheral hospitals among their patients with late 
presenting CDH. 

When diagnosis of CDH is missed in the neonatal 
period, the patient usually presents later with 
respiratory events (Elhalaby EA and Abo Sikeena, 
2002) like the index patient who presented with 
recurrent episodes of respiratory distress. They can 
also present with other gastrointestinal problems or a 
combination of both (Davenport   M     and    Holmes  K, 
1995). Respiratory distress in the   index   patient    was  
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aggravated by ingestion of feeds. This is not surprising 
as respiratory symptoms in CDH are said to worsen 
with swallowing of air and food as these results in 
distension of the intra-thoracic stomach and intestines 
which further compress the poorly developed 
pulmonary tissue (Radovic SV, 2015). 

Surgical correction is recommended in all cases of 
CDH to avoid complications (Balanescu et al., 2012) but 
sadly the index case was lost to follow up before the 
surgery could be done. This highlights the need for free 
health care for Nigerian children. 
 
 
CONCLUSION    
 
Late presenting CDH usually presents with diagnostic 
challenges. A high index of suspicion is required for 
early diagnosis and prompt treatment in order to 
prevent complications. 
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